



Bid 21-163 - FY 2022 Roadway Signs & Supplies
Bid Opening: September 16, 2021 at 2:00 PM
 All Bids are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviews

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
1A	Stop	30X30	\$30.40	\$41.50	\$42.00
1B	Stop	36x36	\$43.80	\$59.60	\$60.00
1C	Stop	48x48	\$77.86	\$106.90	\$108.00
2A	Yield	30x30x30	\$16.36	\$23.56	\$25.31
2B	Yield	36x36x36	\$23.20	\$31.00	\$47.25
2C	Yield	48x48x48	\$36.24	\$54.50	\$81.00
2D	Yield	60x60x60	\$65.73	\$85.00	\$101.25
3A	To Oncoming Traffic (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
3B	To Oncoming Traffic (plaque)	36x30	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
3C	To Oncoming Traffic (plaque)	48x36	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
4A	All Way (plaque)	18x6	\$4.58	\$5.05	\$5.06
4B	All Way (plaque)	30x12	\$12.25	\$16.83	\$16.88
5A	Yield Here to Peds	36X36	\$44.82	\$64.50	\$60.75
6A	In-Street Ped Crossing	12x36	\$73.53	\$27.50	\$20.25
7A	Speed Limit	18X24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
7B	Speed Limit	24X30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
7C	Speed Limit	30X36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
7D	Speed Limit	36X48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
7E	Speed Limit	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
8A	Unless Otherwise Posted (plaque)	24X18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
9A	Fines Higher (plaque)	24X18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
9B	Fines Higher (plaque)	36X24	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
9C	Fines Higher (plaque)	48X36	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
10A	Fines Double (plaque)	24X18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
10B	Fines Double (plaque)	36X24	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
10C	Fines Double (plaque)	48X36	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
11A	No Right Turn	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.20	\$27.00
11B	No Right Turn	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
11C	No Right Turn	48x48	\$79.68	\$107.90	\$108.00
12A	No Left Turn	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.20	\$27.00
12B	No Left Turn	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
12C	No Left Turn	48x48	\$79.68	\$107.90	\$108.00
13A	No Turns	24x24	\$19.92	\$26.92	\$27.00
13B	No Turns	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
13C	No Turns	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
14A	No U-Turn	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.20	\$27.00
14B	No U-Turn	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
14C	No U-Turn	48x48	\$79.68	\$107.90	\$108.00
15A	Left Turn Only	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
16A	Thru Only	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
17A	Optional Movement Lane Control	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
18A	Right Lane Must Turn Right	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
18B	Right Lane Must Turn Right	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
19A	Left Lane Must Turn Left	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
19B	Left Lane Must Turn Left	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
20A	Left Only/Left-Thru	Varies x 30	\$49.20	\$50.48	\$50.63
20B	Left Only/Left-Thru	Varies x 36	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
21A	Left Only/Left-Thru/Right Only	Varies x 30	\$49.20	\$67.30	\$67.50
21B	Left Only/Left-Thru/Right Only	Varies x 36	\$59.04	\$100.95	\$81.00
22A	Left Only/Thru Only/Right Only	Varies x 30	\$49.20	\$67.30	\$67.50
22B	Left Only/Thru Only/Right Only	Varies x 36	\$59.04	\$100.95	\$81.00
23A	Left Only/Left Only/Thru Only/Right Only	Varies x 30	\$49.20	\$75.71	\$84.38
23B	Left Only/Left Only/Thru Only/Right Only	Varies x 36	\$59.04	\$121.14	\$101.25
24A	Left Only/Left Only/Thru Only/Thru-Right	Varies x 30	\$49.20	\$75.71	\$84.38
24B	Left Only/Left Only/Thru Only/Thru-Right	Varies x 36	\$59.04	\$121.14	\$101.25
25A	Two-Way Left Turn Only (post-mounted)	24x36	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
25B	Two-Way Left Turn Only (post-mounted)	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
26A	Begin	30x12	\$12.25	\$16.83	\$16.88
27A	End	30x12	\$12.25	\$16.83	\$16.88
28A	Keep Right	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
28B	Keep Right	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
28C	Keep Right	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
28D	Keep Right	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
29A	Do Not Drive on Shoulder	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
29B	Do Not Drive on Shoulder	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
29C	Do Not Drive on Shoulder	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
29D	Do Not Drive on Shoulder	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
30A	Do Not Pass on Shoulder	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
30B	Do Not Pass on Shoulder	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
30C	Do Not Pass on Shoulder	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
30D	Do Not Pass on Shoulder	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
31A	Do Not Enter	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
31B	Do Not Enter	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
31C	Do Not Enter	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
32A	Wrong Way	30x18	\$18.45	\$25.24	\$25.31

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
32B	Wrong Way	36x24	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
32C	Wrong Way	42x30	\$43.05	\$58.89	\$59.06
33A	No Trucks	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.20	\$27.00
33B	No Trucks	30x30	\$31.13	\$42.30	\$42.19
33C	No Trucks	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
34A	No Motor Vehicles	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
35A	No Commercial Vehicles	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
35B	No Commercial Vehicles	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
36A	One Way	36x12	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
36B	One Way	54x18	\$33.21	\$45.43	\$45.56
37A	One Way	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
37B	One Way	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
37C	One Way	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
37D	One Way	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
37E	One Way	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
38A	Roundabout Directional 2 Chevrons	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
39A	Roundabout Directional 3 chevrons	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
40A	Roundabout Circulation (plaque)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
41A	Begin One Way	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
41B	Begin One Way	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
42A	End One Way	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
42B	End One Way	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
43A	No Parking Anytime ß	12x18	\$7.59	\$10.10	\$10.13
44A	No Parking Symbol Time	12x18	\$8.05	\$10.30	\$10.13
45A	No Parking Time à	12x18	\$7.59	\$10.10	\$10.13
46A	No Parking Except Sundays & Holidays	12x18	\$7.59	\$10.10	\$10.13
47A	One Hour Parking Time	12x18	\$7.59	\$10.10	\$10.13
48A	Reserved Parking Accessible Symbol	12x18	\$8.05	\$10.30	\$10.13
49A	2 Hour Parking Time	12x18	\$7.59	\$10.10	\$10.13
50A	Van Accessible (plaque)	18x9	\$6.05	\$7.60	\$7.56
51A	No Parking (symbol)	12x12	\$6.17	\$6.90	\$6.75
51B	No Parking (symbol)	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.10	\$27.00
51C	No Parking (symbol)	30x30	\$31.13	\$42.30	\$42.19
51D	No Parking (symbol)	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
51E	No Parking (symbol)	48x48	\$79.68	\$107.90	\$108.00
52A	No Parking	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
52B	No Parking	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
52C	No Parking	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
52D	No Parking	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
53A	Pedestrian Signs	9x15	\$5.04	\$7.70	\$6.33
54A	Left on Green Arrow Only	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
54B	Left on Green Arrow Only	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
54C	Left on Green Arrow Only	48x60	\$98.40	\$134.60	\$135.00
55A	Stop Here on Red	24x36	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
55B	Stop Here on Red	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
56A	Stop Here on Red	24x36	\$29.52	\$40.38	\$40.50
56B	Stop Here on Red	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
57A	Do Not Block Intersection	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
58A	Left (Right) Turn Signal	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
59A	No Turn on Red	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
59B	No Turn on Red	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
60A	No (Right) Turn on Red	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
60B	No (Right) Turn on Red	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
61A	No Turn on Red	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
62A	Left Turn Yield on Green	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
63A	Emergency Signal	42x30	\$43.05	\$58.89	\$59.06
64A	Turning Vehicles Yield to Peds	30x30	\$31.13	\$49.50	\$42.19
65A	Right Turn on Red after Stop	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
66A	Push Button to Turn on Warning Lights	9x12	\$4.50	\$5.20	\$5.06
67A	Road Closed	48x30	\$49.20	\$67.30	\$67.50
68A	Weight Limit	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
68B	Weight Limit	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
69A	Hazardous Material	24x24	\$19.92	\$27.10	\$27.00
69B	Hazardous Material	30x30	\$31.13	\$42.30	\$42.19
69C	Hazardous Material	36x36	\$44.82	\$60.80	\$60.75
69D	Hazardous Material	42x42	\$61.01	\$83.00	\$82.69
70A	Bike Lane	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
71A	Bike Lane (plaques)	24x8	\$7.40	\$9.10	\$9.00
72A	Bike Lane (plaques)	24x8	\$7.40	\$9.10	\$9.00
73A	Begin Right Turn Lane Yield to Bikes	36x30	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
74A	Bicycles May Use Full Lane	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
75A	No Parking Bike Lane	12x18	\$8.05	\$10.10	\$10.13
76A	Bike Route	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
77A	Turn Left (Right)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
77B	Turn Left (Right)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
77C	Turn Left (Right)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
78A	Curve Left (Right)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
78B	Curve Left (Right)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
78C	Curve Left (Right)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
79A	Reverse Turn Left (Right)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
79B	Reverse Turn Left (Right)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
79C	Reverse Turn Left (Right)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
80A	Reverse Curve Left (Right)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
80B	Reverse Curve Left (Right)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
80C	Reverse Curve Left (Right)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
81A	Winding Road	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
81B	Winding Road	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
81C	Winding Road	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
82A	One-Direction Large Arrow	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
82B	One-Direction Large Arrow	60x30	\$61.50	\$84.13	\$84.38
83A	Two-Direction Large Arrow	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
83B	Two-Direction Large Arrow	60x30	\$61.50	\$84.13	\$84.38
84A	Chevron Alignment	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
84B	Chevron Alignment	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
84C	Chevron Alignment	30x36	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
84D	Chevron Alignment	36x48	\$59.04	\$80.76	\$81.00
85A	Intersection Warning	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
85B	Intersection Warning	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
85C	Intersection Warning	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
85D	Intersection Warning	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
86A	Side Road Intersection	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
86B	Side Road Intersection	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
86C	Side Road Intersection	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
86D	Side Road Intersection	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
87A	Roundabout Intersection	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
87B	Roundabout Intersection	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
87C	Roundabout Intersection	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
87D	Roundabout Intersection	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
88A	Stop Sign Ahead Symbol	30x30	\$31.55	\$44.50	\$42.19
88B	Stop Sign Ahead Symbol	48x48	\$79.38	\$116.00	\$108.00
89A	Yield Sign Ahead Symbol	30x30	\$31.55	\$44.50	\$42.19
89B	Yield Sign Ahead Symbol	48x48	\$79.38	\$116.00	\$108.00
90A	Signal Ahead Symbol	30x30	\$32.01	\$43.50	\$42.19
90B	Signal Ahead Symbol	48x48	\$79.84	\$112.00	\$108.00
91A	Be Prepared to Stop	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
91B	Be Prepared to Stop	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
91C	Be Prepared to Stop	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
92A	Reduced Speed Limit Ahead	36x36	\$44.82	\$64.00	\$60.75
92B	Reduced Speed Limit Ahead	48x48	\$79.68	\$116.00	\$108.00
93A	Merge Left (Right)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
93B	Merge Left (Right)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
93C	Merge Left (Right)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
94A	Right (Left) Lane Ends	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
94B	Right (Left) Lane Ends	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
94C	Right (Left) Lane Ends	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
95A	Added Lane Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
95B	Added Lane Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
95C	Added Lane Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
96A	Cross Traffic Does Not Stop	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
96B	Cross Traffic Does Not Stop	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
96C	Cross Traffic Does Not Stop	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
97A	Traffic From Left (Right) Does Not Stop (plaque)	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
97B	Traffic From Left (Right) Does Not Stop (plaque)	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
97C	Traffic From Left (Right) Does Not Stop (plaque)	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
98A	Oncoming Traffic Does Not Stop (plaque)	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
98B	Oncoming Traffic Does Not Stop (plaque)	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
98C	Oncoming Traffic Does Not Stop (plaque)	48x24	\$39.36	\$53.84	\$54.00
99A	Divided Highway	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
99B	Divided Highway	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
100A	Divided Highway Ends	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
100B	Divided Highway Ends	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
101A	Two-Way Traffic	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
101B	Two-Way Traffic	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
102A	Bump	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
102B	Bump	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
102C	Bump	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
102D	Bump	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
103A	Dip	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
103B	Dip	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
103C	Dip	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
103D	Dip	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
104A	Bicycle	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
104B	Bicycle	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
104C	Bicycle	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
104D	Bicycle	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
105A	Pedestrian	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
105B	Pedestrian	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
105C	Pedestrian	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
105D	Pedestrian	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
106A	Large Animals	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
106B	Large Animals	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
106C	Large Animals	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.75	\$60.75
106D	Large Animals	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
107A	Emergency Vehicle	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
107B	Emergency Vehicle	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
107C	Emergency Vehicle	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
107D	Emergency Vehicle	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
108A	Emergency Signal Ahead (plaque)	36x30	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
109A	Bicycle/Pedestrian	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
109B	Bicycle/Pedestrian	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
109C	Bicycle/Pedestrian	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
109D	Bicycle/Pedestrian	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
110A	Trail X-ing (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
110B	Trail X-ing (plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
110C	Trail X-ing (plaque)	36x30	\$36.90	\$50.48	\$50.63
111A	Double Arrow	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
111B	Double Arrow	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
112A	Low Clearance (with arrows)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
112B	Low Clearance (with arrows)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
112C	Low Clearance (with arrows)	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
113A	Low Clearance	78x24	\$63.96	\$87.49	\$87.75
114A	Advisory Speed (plaque)	18x18	\$12.21	\$15.14	\$15.19
114B	Advisory Speed (plaque)	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
114C	Advisory Speed (plaque)	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
115A	Dead End	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
115B	Dead End	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
115C	Dead End	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
115D	Dead End	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
116A	No Outlet	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
116B	No Outlet	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
116C	No Outlet	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
116D	No Outlet	48x48	\$78.72	\$107.68	\$108.00
117A	Dead End (with arrow)	36x8	\$10.68	\$13.46	\$13.50
118A	No Outlet (with arrow)	36x8	\$10.68	\$13.46	\$13.50
119A	Share the Road (plaque)	18x24	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
119B	Share the Road (plaque)	24x30	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
120A	XX Feet	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
120B	XX Feet	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
121A	XX Ft	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
121B	XX Ft	30x18	\$18.45	\$25.24	\$25.31
122A	XX Miles (2-line plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
123A	XX Miles (1-line plaque)	30x12	\$12.30	\$16.83	\$16.88
124A	Next XX Feet (plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
125A	Left Arrow	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
126A	Advanced Left (Right) Arrow	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
127A	Downward Diagonal Arrow Left (Right) (plaque)	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
127B	Downward Diagonal Arrow Left (Right) (plaque)	30x18	\$18.45	\$25.24	\$25.31
128A	Ahead (plaque)	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
128B	Ahead (plaque)	30x18	\$18.45	\$25.24	\$25.31
129A	When Flashing (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$20.19	\$20.25
130A	Roundabout (plaque)	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
131A	Grade Crossing Advance Warning	36 Dia.	\$40.46	\$60.57	\$60.75
131B	Grade Crossing Advance Warning	48 Dia.	\$66.84	\$107.68	\$108.00
132A	Interstate Route Sign (1 or 2 digits)	24x24	\$25.44	\$28.00	\$27.00
132B	Interstate Route Sign (1 or 2 digits)	36x36	\$51.12	\$63.50	\$60.75
133A	State Route Sign (1 or 2 digits)	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
133B	State Route Sign (1 or 2 digits)	36x36	\$44.28	\$60.57	\$60.75
134A	State Route Sign (3 digits)	30x24	\$24.60	\$33.65	\$33.75
134B	State Route Sign (3 digits)	45x36	\$55.35	\$75.72	\$75.94
135A	Junction	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
135B	Junction	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
136A	North	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
136B	North	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
137A	East	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
137B	East	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
138A	South	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
138B	South	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
139A	West	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
139B	West	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
140A	To	24x12	\$11.18	\$13.46	\$13.50
140B	To	36x18	\$22.14	\$30.29	\$30.38
141A	Advance Turn Arrow Left	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
141B	Advance Turn Arrow Left	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
142A	Directional Arrow Left/Right	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
142B	Directional Arrow Left/Right	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
143A	Directional Arrow Upward Right (Left)	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
143B	Directional Arrow Upward Right (Left)	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
144A	Directional Arrow Downward Left (Right)	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
144B	Directional Arrow Downward Left (Right)	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
145A	Directional Arrow Straight	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
145B	Directional Arrow Straight	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
146A	Directional Arrow Left & Right	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
146B	Directional Arrow Left & Right	30x21	\$22.20	\$29.44	\$29.53
147A	Street Name (1 line)	Varies x 8	\$16.98	\$26.50	\$38.00
147B	Street Name (1 line)	Varies x 12	\$25.46	\$53.50	\$64.13
147C	Street Name (1 line)	Varies x 18	\$38.18	\$89.55	\$106.88
148A	Advance Street Name (2 lines)	Varies x 30	\$63.66	\$149.25	\$302.81
148B	Advance Street Name (2 lines)	Varies x 42	\$77.00	\$348.25	\$781.38
149A	Advance Street Name (3 lines)	Varies x 42	\$77.00	\$348.25	\$781.38
149B	Advance Street Name (3 lines)	Varies x 66	\$270.84	\$547.25	No Bid
150A	Advance Street Name (4 lines)	Varies x 60	\$270.84	\$497.50	No Bid
150B	Advance Street Name (4 lines)	Varies x 84	\$255.36	\$696.50	No Bid
151A	Street Name (1 line) Extruded White Blanks	6x30	\$11.66	\$23.25	\$19.06
151B	Street Name (1 line) Extruded White Blanks	6x36	\$13.96	\$27.90	\$22.88
151C	Street Name(1 line) Extruded White Blanks	6x42	\$16.33	\$32.55	\$26.69
152A	Street Name (1 line) Extruded White Blanks	9x36	\$19.87	\$33.30	\$34.31
152B	Street Name (1 line) Extruded White Blanks	9x42	\$23.33	\$38.85	\$39.96
153A	Geographical Features (Creek)	Varies x 18	\$38.28	\$59.70	\$57.19
153B	Geographical Features (Creek)	Varies x 36	\$76.56	\$179.10	\$183.00
154A	Library	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
154B	Library	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
155A	Right/Left Arrow	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
155B	Right/Left Arrow	30x21	\$12.25	\$29.48	\$29.53
156A	Straight Arrow	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
156B	Straight Arrow	30x21	\$12.25	\$29.48	\$29.53
157A	Hospital	24x24	\$19.68	\$26.92	\$27.00
157B	Hospital	30x30	\$30.75	\$42.06	\$42.19
158A	Right/Left Arrow	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
158B	Right/Left Arrow	30x21	\$12.25	\$29.48	\$29.53
159A	Straight Arrow	21x15	\$11.93	\$14.74	\$14.72
159B	Straight Arrow	30x21	\$12.25	\$29.48	\$29.53
160A	End Work Zone Speed Limit	24x36	\$29.52	\$46.98	\$40.50
160B	End Work Zone Speed Limit	36x54	\$66.42	\$105.71	\$101.25
161A	Do Not Pass	24x30	\$24.60	\$39.15	\$33.75
161B	Do Not Pass	36x48	\$59.04	\$93.96	\$81.00
162A	Narrow Keep Right	18x30	\$18.45	\$29.36	\$25.31
163A	Pedestrian Crosswalk	36x18	\$22.14	\$35.24	\$30.38
164A	Sidewalk Closed	24x12	\$11.18	\$15.66	\$13.50
165A	Turn Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
165B	Turn Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
165C	Turn Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
166A	Curve Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
166B	Curve Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
166C	Curve Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
167A	Reverse Turn Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
167B	Reverse Turn Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
167C	Reverse Turn Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
168A	Reverse Curve Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
168B	Reverse Curve Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
168C	Reverse Curve Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
169A	Stop Ahead	30x30	\$31.55	\$58.00	\$42.19
169B	Stop Ahead	36x36	\$45.51	\$83.00	\$60.75
169C	Stop Ahead	48x48	\$79.68	\$148.00	\$108.00
170A	Yield Ahead	30x30	\$31.55	\$58.00	\$42.19
170B	Yield Ahead	36x36	\$45.51	\$83.00	\$60.75
170C	Yield Ahead	48x48	\$79.68	\$148.00	\$108.00
171A	Signal Ahead	30x30	\$32.01	\$58.00	\$42.19
171B	Signal Ahead	36x36	\$45.51	\$83.00	\$60.75
171C	Signal Ahead	48x48	\$79.84	\$148.00	\$108.00
172A	Be Prepared to Stop	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
172B	Be Prepared to Stop	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
172C	Be Prepared to Stop	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
173A	Reduced Speed Limit Ahead	30x30	\$31.13	\$58.00	\$42.19
173B	Reduced Speed Limit Ahead	36x36	\$44.82	\$83.00	\$60.75
173C	Reduced Speed Limit Ahead	48x48	\$79.68	\$148.00	\$108.00
174A	Merging Traffic Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
174B	Merging Traffic Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
174C	Merging Traffic Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
175A	Lane Ends Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
175B	Lane Ends Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
175C	Lane Ends Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
176A	Added Lane Right (Left)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
176B	Added Lane Right (Left)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
176C	Added Lane Right (Left)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
177A	Road Narrows	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
177B	Road Narrows	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
177C	Road Narrows	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
178A	Divided Highway	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
178B	Divided Highway	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
178C	Divided Highway	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
179A	Divided Highway Ends	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
179B	Divided Highway Ends	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
179C	Divided Highway Ends	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
180A	Two-Way Traffic	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
180B	Two-Way Traffic	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
180C	Two-Way Traffic	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
181A	Bump	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
181B	Bump	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
181C	Bump	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
182A	Dip	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
182B	Dip	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
182C	Dip	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
183A	Truck Crossing	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
183B	Truck Crossing	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
183C	Truck Crossing	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
184A	Uneven Lanes	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
184B	Uneven Lanes	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
184C	Uneven Lanes	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
185A	Grooved Pavement	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
185B	Grooved Pavement	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
185C	Grooved Pavement	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
186A	Motorcycle (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$26.49	\$20.25
186B	Motorcycle (plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$44.15	\$33.75
187A	Shoulder Drop Off (Symbol)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
187B	Shoulder Drop Off (Symbol)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
187C	Shoulder Drop Off (Symbol)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
188A	Shoulder Drop-Off (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$26.49	\$20.25
188B	Shoulder Drop-Off (plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$44.15	\$33.75
189A	Road May Flood	24x24	\$19.68	\$35.32	\$27.00
189B	Road May Flood	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
189C	Road May Flood	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
190A	No Shoulder	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
190B	No Shoulder	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
190C	No Shoulder	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
191A	Steel Plate Ahead	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
191B	Steel Plate Ahead	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
191C	Steel Plate Ahead	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
192A	XX Feet (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$26.49	\$20.25
192B	XX Feet (plaque)	30x24	\$24.60	\$44.15	\$33.75
193A	Flagger (symbol)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
193B	Flagger (symbol)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
193C	Flagger (symbol)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
194A	Fresh Oil (Tar)	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
194B	Fresh Oil (Tar)	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
194C	Fresh Oil (Tar)	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
195A	Shoulder Work	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
195B	Shoulder Work	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
195C	Shoulder Work	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
196A	Shoulder Closed	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
196B	Shoulder Closed	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
196C	Shoulder Closed	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
197A	Utility Work Ahead	30x30	\$30.75	\$55.19	\$42.19
197B	Utility Work Ahead	36x36	\$44.28	\$79.47	\$60.75
197C	Utility Work Ahead	48x48	\$78.72	\$141.28	\$108.00
198A	End Road Work	36x18	\$22.14	\$39.74	\$30.38
198B	End Road Work	48x24	\$39.36	\$70.64	\$54.00
199A	Work Zone (plaque)	24x18	\$14.76	\$26.49	\$20.25
199B	Work Zone (plaque)	36x24	\$29.52	\$52.98	\$40.50
200A	Detour	24x12	\$11.18	\$17.66	\$13.50
200B	Detour	30x15	\$15.40	\$33.11	\$21.09
201A	End Detour	24x18	\$14.76	\$26.49	\$20.25
202A	End	24x12	\$11.18	\$17.66	\$13.50
203A	Detour	30x24	\$24.60	\$44.15	\$33.75
203B	Detour	48x36	\$59.04	\$105.96	\$81.00
204A	Detour	48x18	\$29.52	\$52.98	\$40.50
205A	School	30x30	\$35.86	\$48.70	\$42.19
205B	School	36x36	\$51.66	\$69.90	\$60.75
205C	School	48x48	\$85.81	\$124.90	\$108.00
206A	Reduced School Speed Limit Ahead	30x30	\$43.31	\$52.50	\$42.19
206B	Reduced School Speed Limit Ahead	36x36	\$48.01	\$74.50	\$60.75
206C	Reduced School Speed Limit Ahead	48x48	\$100.31	\$131.00	\$108.00
207A	End School Zone	24x30	\$24.60	\$39.15	\$33.75
207B	End School Zone	36x48	\$59.04	\$93.96	\$81.00
208A	End School Speed Limit	24x30	\$24.60	\$39.15	\$33.75
208B	End School Speed Limit	36x48	\$59.04	\$93.96	\$81.00

Vulcan Signs	Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Osburn Associates, Inc.
P.O. Box 1850	P.O. Box 329	P.O. Box 912
Foley, AL 36536	Frankfort, OH 45628	Logan, OH 43138
800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-523-8917
vulcan3@vulvaninc.com	dlightle@lightleenterprises.com	jennifert@osburns.com

Item	Sign or Plaque	Size	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
209A	When Children Are Present	24x10	\$9.46	\$13.08	\$11.25
209B	When Children Are Present	36x18	\$22.14	\$35.24	\$30.38
210A	School	24x8	\$9.49	\$10.49	\$9.00
210B	School	36x12	\$18.66	\$23.49	\$20.25
211A	Diagonal Downward Arrow Left (Right)	21x15	\$15.36	\$17.15	\$14.72
211B	Diagonal Downward Arrow Left (Right)	24x12	\$13.91	\$15.66	\$13.50
211C	Diagonal Downward Arrow Left (Right)	30x18	\$23.31	\$29.36	\$25.31
212A	Ahead	24x12	\$13.91	\$15.66	\$13.50
212B	Ahead	30x18	\$23.31	\$29.36	\$25.31
213A	3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000 or Equivalent (Orange, Yellow, or White) – 30 in x 50 yd		\$952.50	\$1,009.80	\$806.25
214A	3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting or Equivalent (Red, Yellow, Green, or Black) – 48 in x 50 yd		\$750.00	\$776.50	\$708.00
215A	3M ElectroCut Film Series 1170 or Equivalent – 48 in x 50 yd		\$564.00	\$651.00	\$552.00
216A	Clear Choice AT60n Film Application Tape or Equivalent – 6 ½" in x 100 yd		No Bid	\$42.00	\$29.25
217A	Clear Choice AT60n Film Application Tape or Equivalent – 8 ½" in x 100 yd		No Bid	\$44.00	\$38.25
218A	Clear Choice AT60n Film Application Tape or Equivalent – 12" in x 100 yd		\$55.65	\$46.00	\$54.00
219A	2" Inch Perforated Square Steel Tube Posts - 10 ft with 3/8" punch holes on 1" centers		\$60.47	\$82.16	No Bid
220A	2" Inch Perforated Square Steel Tube Posts - 12 ft with 3/8" punch holes on 1" centers		\$72.42	\$98.60	No Bid
221A	U-Channel – 10 ft with 3/8" punch holes on 1" centers tapered at one end		\$24.40	\$26.70	No Bid
222A	U-Channel – 12 ft with 3/8" punch holes on 1" centers tapered at one end		\$28.92	\$32.00	No Bid
223A	Square Post Sign Bracket Compatible with 2" Square Post Extruded 5 ½"		\$5.50	\$3.30	\$6.25
224A	Square Post Sign Bracket Compatible with 2" Square Post Extruded 12"		\$9.50	\$10.10	\$9.75
225A	Adjustable Cross Piece Street Sign Bracket Extruded		\$9.50	\$5.40	\$5.25
226A	Pipe and Square post Street Sign Bracket Extruded 12"		\$9.50	\$10.10	No Bid
227A	Pipe Post Bracket Mounts 1 Sign		\$3.50	\$1.80	\$4.25
228A	Pipe Post Bracket Mounts 2 Signs		\$8.50	\$2.80	\$5.25
229A	U Channel Heavy Duty Street Sign Bracket Extruded 5 ½" 90 degree		\$4.25	\$3.30	\$4.25
230A	U Channel Heavy Duty Street Sign Bracket Extruded 5 ½" 180 degree		\$4.25	\$3.30	\$4.25
231A	U Channel Heavy Duty Street Sign Bracket Extruded 12" 90 degree		\$9.50	\$10.10	\$9.75
232A	U Channel Heavy Duty Street Sign Bracket Extruded 12" 180 degree		\$9.50	\$10.10	\$9.75
233A	Heavy Duty Fixed Cross Piece 5 ½"		\$6.50	\$10.10	\$4.75
234A	Heavy Duty Fixed Cross Piece 12"		\$9.50	\$10.10	\$9.75
235A	Square Post Corner Bolt For 2" Square Post 2 ½"		\$0.52	\$0.75	\$0.98
236A	Square Post Anchors Compatible with 2" Square post 36" 12 gauge outside dimension 2 ¼" x 2 ¼"		\$21.96	\$27.60	No Bid