



21-113 - Employee Uniforms
Bid Opening 2:00 PM, Monday, January 18, 2020
All proposals are subject to correction after they have been completely reviewed

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
1	1	EA	Long Sleeve Poly/Cotton Blend Work Shirt Button Up		Men's	Light Tan, Light Blue, Navy	Embroidery; Brown		
			Sizes	Cost				Brand Name	Model Number
			Small	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP14
			Medium	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP15
			Large	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP16
			XL	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP17
			2X	\$19.35				Red Kap	SP18
			3X	\$19.35				Red Kap	SP19
			4X	\$19.35				Red Kap	SP20
			5X	\$19.35				Red Kap	SP21
		6X	\$19.35	Red Kap	SP22				
2	1	EA	Short Sleeve Poly/Cotton Blend Work Shirt Button Up		Men's	Light Tan, Light Blue, Navy	Embroidery; Brown		
			Sizes	Cost				Brand Name	Model Number
			Small	\$14.65				Red Kap	SP24
			Medium	\$14.65				Red Kap	SP25
			Large	\$14.65				Red Kap	SP26
			XL	\$14.65				Red Kap	SP27
			2X	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP28
			3X	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP29
			4X	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP30
			5X	\$16.80				Red Kap	SP31
		6X	\$16.80	Red Kap	SP32				
3	1	EA	Short Sleeve 50/50 Blend Work Polo w/ Pocket		Men's	Ash, Navy, Oxford, White, Light Blue	Embroidery; Black/Gray, White/Navy, Black/Navy, Navy/Lt. Blue		
			Sizes	Cost				Brand Name	Model Number
			Small	\$12.30				Jerzees	436NP
			Medium	\$12.30				Jerzees	436NP
			Large	\$12.30				Jerzees	436NP
			XL	\$12.30				Jerzees	436NP
			2X	\$16.45				Jerzees	436NP
			3X	\$17.75				Jerzees	436NP
		4X	\$17.75	Jerzees	436NP				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
4	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve w/Pocket, 100% Pre-Shrunk Cotton		Universal	Tan, Navy, Light Blue	Screenprint; Black/Orange, Black/Tan, White/Navy, Black/Lime, Navy/Lt. Blue
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC61P			
	Medium	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC61P		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC61P			
	XL	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC61P			
	2X	\$11.90	Port+Company	PC61P		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$12.15	Port+Company	PC61P			
	4X	\$12.40	Port+Company	PC61P			
5X	\$14.95	Gildan	2300				
5	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve w/Pocket, 50/50 Blend		Universal	Safety Orange, Lime Green	Screenprint; Black/Orange, Black/Tan, White/Navy, Black/Lime, Navy/Lt. Blue
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC55P			
	Medium	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC55P		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC55P			
	XL	\$8.95	Port+Company	PC55P			
	2X	\$11.90	Port+Company	PC55P		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$12.15	Port+Company	PC55P			
	4X	\$12.40	Port+Company	PC55P			
5X	\$14.95	Gildan	2300				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
6	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve w/Pocket, 100% Pre-Shrunk Cotton		Universal	Navy	Screen Print; Black/Orange, White/Navy, Black/Lime
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$11.85	Port+Company	PC61LSP			
	Medium	\$11.85	Port+Company	PC61LSP		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$11.85	Port+Company	PC61LSP			
	XL	\$11.85	Port+Company	PC61LSP			
	2X	\$14.40	Port+Company	PC61LSP		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$15.25	Port+Company	PC61LSP			
	4X	\$16.50	Port+Company	PC61LSP			
5X		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
7	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve w/Pocket, 50/50 Blend		Universal	Safety Orange, Lime Green	Screen Print; Black/Orange, White/Navy, Black/Lime
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$12.50	Gildan	2410			
	Medium	\$12.50	Gildan	2410		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$12.50	Gildan	2410			
	XL	\$12.50	Gildan	2410			
	2X	\$14.20	Gildan	2410		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$16.15	Gildan	2410			
	4X	\$16.20	Gildan	2410			
5X	\$16.40	Gildan	2410				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
8	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, ANSI Dri-Fit, w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; Birdseye Mesh	Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$12.30	Erb				90065
	Medium	\$12.30	Erb		90065		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$12.30	Erb		90065		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$12.30	Erb		90065		
	2X	\$12.30	Erb		90065		
	3X	\$12.30	Erb		90065		
	4X	\$12.30	Erb		90065		
5X	\$12.30	Erb	90065				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
9	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, Dri-Fit, w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; Birdseye Mesh	Universal	Lime Green	Screen Print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$9.75	Erb				9006
	Medium	\$9.75	Erb		9006		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$9.75	Erb		9006		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$9.75	Erb		9006		
	2X	\$9.75	Erb		9006		
	3X	\$9.75	Erb		9006		
	4X	\$9.75	Erb		9006		
5X	\$9.75	Erb	9006				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
10	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve, ANSI Dri-Fit, w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; Birdseye Mesh	Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$15.75	Erb				90075
	Medium	\$15.75	Erb		90075		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$15.75	Erb		90075		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$15.75	Erb		90075		
	2X	\$15.75	Erb		90075		
	3X	\$15.75	Erb		90075		
	4X	\$15.75	Erb		90075		
5X	\$15.75	Erb	90075				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
11	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve, Dri-Fit, w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; Birdseye Mesh		Universal	Lime Green,	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$12.75	Erb	9007			
	Medium	\$12.75	Erb	9007		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$12.75	Erb	9007			
	XL	\$12.75	Erb	9007			
	2X	\$12.75	Erb	9007		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$12.75	Erb	9007			
	4X	\$12.75	Erb	9007			
5X	\$12.75	Erb	9007				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
12	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, ANSI Knit Jersey w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; w/ Moisture Wicking		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$13.65	Erb	96015			
	Medium	\$13.65	Erb	96015		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$13.65	Erb	96015			
	XL	\$13.65	Erb	96015			
	2X	\$13.65	Erb	96015		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$13.65	Erb	96015			
	4X	\$13.65	Erb	96015			
5X	\$13.65	Erb	96015				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
13	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, Knit Jersey w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; w/ Moisture Wicking		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	Medium	\$11.70	Erb	9601		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	XL	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	2X	\$11.70	Erb	9601		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	4X	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
5X	\$11.70	Erb	9601				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
14	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, Knit Jersey w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; w/ Moisture Wicking		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	Medium	\$11.70	Erb	9601		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	XL	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	2X	\$11.70	Erb	9601		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
	4X	\$11.70	Erb	9601			
5X	\$11.70	Erb	9601				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
15	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve, ANSI Knit Jersey w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; w/ Moisture Wicking		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$16.65	Erb	96025			
	Medium	\$16.65	Erb	96025		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$16.65	Erb	96025			
	XL	\$16.65	Erb	96025			
	2X	\$16.65	Erb	96025		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$16.65	Erb	96025			
	4X	\$16.65	Erb	96025			
5X	\$16.65	Erb	96025				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
16	1	EA	T-Shirt Long Sleeve, Knit Jersey w/Pocket, 100% Polyester; w/ Moisture Wicking		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$14.70	Erb	9602			
	Medium	\$14.70	Erb	9602		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$14.70	Erb	9602			
	XL	\$14.70	Erb	9602			
	2X	\$14.70	Erb	9602		List Other Color Options	
	3X	\$14.70	Erb	9602			
	4X	\$14.70	Erb	9602			
5X	\$14.70	Erb	9602				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
17	1	EA	T-Shirt Sleeveless, No Pocket	Universal	Lime Green	Screen Print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$9.10	Gildan		2700		
	Medium	\$9.10	Gildan		2700		
	Large	\$9.10	Gildan		2700		
	XL	\$9.10	Gildan		2700		
	2X	\$12.10	Gildan		2700		
	3X	No Bid					
	4X						
5X							
					Provided an alternate as well		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
18	1	EA	T-Shirt Short Sleeve, ANSI Dri-Fit, w/Pocket, 100% Polyester, Birdseye Mesh - Tall	Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screen Print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	No Bid					
	Medium	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
	Large	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
	XL	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
	2X	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
	3X	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
	4X	\$13.95	Erb		90065T		
5X	\$13.95	Erb	90065T				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
19	1	EA	Pants, Poly Cotton Blend, Plain Front	Men's	Brown, Navy	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	28	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	30	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	32	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	34	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	36	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	38	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	40	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	42	\$15.75	Red Kap		PT20		
	44	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	46	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	48	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	50	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	52	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	54	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	56	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
	58	\$18.90	Red Kap		PT20		
60	\$18.90	Red Kap	PT20				
					List Other Color Options		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
20	1	EA	Relaxed Fit Duck Jean (Carpenter), 100% Cotton		Men's	Timber	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number				Can you supply Yes or No
	28	No Bid						List Other Color Options
	30	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	32	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	34	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	36	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	38	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	40	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	42	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	44	\$23.25	Dickies	1933				
	46	\$25.50	Dickies	1933				
	48	\$25.50	Dickies	1933				
	50	\$25.50	Dickies	1933				
	52	No Bid						
	54							
56								
58								
60	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
21	1	EA	Loose Fit Work Pant (Cargo), 100% Cotton		Men's	Khaki, Navy	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number				Can you supply Yes or No
	28	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				List Other Color Options
	30	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	32	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	34	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	36	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	38	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	40	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	42	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	44	\$25.40	Dickies	2321				
	46	\$27.95	Dickies	2321				
	48	\$27.95	Dickies	2321				
	50	\$27.95	Dickies	2321				
	52	\$27.95	Dickies	2321				
	54	\$27.95	Dickies	2321				
56	\$27.95	Dickies	2321					
58	No Bid							
60								

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
22	1	EA	Relaxed Fit Work Pant (Cargo), 100% Cotton		Men's	Khaki, Navy	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	28	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	30	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39		Can you supply Yes or No	
	32	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39		List Other Color Options	
	34	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	36	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	38	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	40	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	42	\$26.15	Dickies	LP39			
	44	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	46	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	48	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	50	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	52	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	54	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
	56	\$28.80	Dickies	LP39			
58	No Bid						
60							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
23	1	EA	Poly Cotton Blend Pants, Plain Front		Women's	Khaki, Navy	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	6	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21		Can you supply Yes or No	
	8	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21		List Other Color Options	
	10	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	12	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	14	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	16	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	18	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	20	\$17.90	Red Kap	PT21			
	22	\$21.45	Red Kap	PT21			
	24	\$21.45	Red Kap	PT21			

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
24	1	EA	Loose Fit Work Pant (Cargo), 100% Cotton		Women's	Khaki, Navy	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	6	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		Can you supply Yes or No	
	8	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	10	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	12	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		List Other Color Options	
	14	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	16	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	18	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	20	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	22	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
24	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
25	1	EA	Loose Fit Work Pant (Cargo), 100% Cotton		Women's	Khaki, Navy	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	6 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		Can you supply Yes or No	
	8 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	10 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	12 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		List Other Color Options	
	14 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	16 Short	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	18 Short	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	20 Short	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	22 Short	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
24 Short	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
26	1	EA	Loose Fit Work Pant (Cargo), 100% Cotton		Women's	Khaki, Navy	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	6 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		Can you supply Yes or No	
	8 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	10 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	12 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39		List Other Color Options	
	14 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	16 Tall	\$26.15	Dickies	FP39			
	18 Tall	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	20 Tall	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
	22 Tall	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39			
24 Tall	\$28.80	Dickies	FW39				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
27	1	EA	Poly Cotton Blend Shorts, (10'), Plain Front		Men's	Brown, Khaki, Navy	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number				Can you supply Yes or No
	28	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				List Other Color Options
	30	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	32	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	34	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	36	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	38	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	40	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	42	\$14.80	Red Kap	PT26				
	44	\$17.75	Red Kap	PT26				
	46	\$17.75	Red Kap	PT26				
	48	\$17.75	Red Kap	PT26				
	50	\$17.75	Red Kap	PT26				
	52	No Bid						
54	No Bid							
56	No Bid							
58	No Bid							
60	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
28	1	EA	Loose Fit Cargo Short (11"), 100% Cotton		Men's	Khaki, Navy	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number				Can you supply Yes or No
	28	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				List Other Color Options
	30	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	32	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	34	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	36	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	38	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	40	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	42	\$22.90	Dickies	LR33				
	44	\$25.25	Dickies	LR33				
	46	\$25.25	Dickies	LR33				
	48	\$25.25	Dickies	LR33				
	50	\$25.25	Dickies	LR33				
	52	No Bid						
54	No Bid							
56	No Bid							
58	No Bid							
60	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
29	1	EA	Relaxed Fit Carpenter Short (11"), 9 oz, 100% Cotton, Hammer Loop, Dual Tool Pocket		Men's	Khaki, Timber Can you supply Yes or No List Other Color Options	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	28	No Bid					
	30						
	32						
	34						
	36						
	38						
	40						
	42						
	44						
	46						
	48						
	50						
	52						
	54						
56							
58							
60							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
30	1	EA	Poly/Cotton Blend Shorts, Plain Front		Women's	Tan, Navy Can you supply Yes or No List Other Color Options	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	6	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	8	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	10	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	12	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	14	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	16	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	18	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	20	\$16.05	Red Kap	PT27			
	22	\$19.25	Red Kap	PT27			
	24	\$19.25	Red Kap	PT27			

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
31	1	EA	Relaxed Fit Cargo Short (10"), 100% Cotton		Women's	Khaki	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	4		No Bid				
	6						
	8						
	10						
	12						
	14						
	16						
	18						
	20						
22							
24							
					Can you supply Yes or No		
					List Other Color Options		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
32	1	EA	Crew Neck Sweatshirt		Universal	Navy, Safety Orange	Screenprint; White/Navy, Black/Orange
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$14.50	Port+Company	PC90			
	Medium	\$14.50	Port+Company	PC90			
	Large	\$14.50	Port+Company	PC90			
	XL	\$14.50	Port+Company	PC90			
	2X	\$17.20	Port+Company	PC90			
	3X	\$17.65	Port+Company	PC90			
	4X	\$18.10	Port+Company	PC90			
	5X		No Bid				
					Can you supply Yes or No		
					List Other Color Options		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
33	1	EA	Hooded Zip front Sweatshirt, Metal Zipper		Universal	Navy, Safety Orange	Screenprint; White/Navy, Black/Orange
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$26.25	Port+Company	PC902H			
	Medium	\$26.25	Port+Company	PC902H			
	Large	\$26.25	Port+Company	PC902H			
	XL	\$26.25	Port+Company	PC902H			
	2X	\$28.05	Port+Company	PC902H			
	3X	\$31.75	Port+Company	PC902H			
	4X	\$33.60	Port+Company	PC902H			
	5X		No Bid				
					Can you supply Yes or No		
					List Other Color Options		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
34	1	EA	ANSI Hooded Zip Front Sweatshirt, Plastic Zipper		Universal	Lime Green	Screenprint; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$34.50	Erb	W375			
	Medium	\$34.50	Erb	W375		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$34.50	Erb	W375		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$34.50	Erb	W375			
	2X	\$34.50	Erb	W375			
	3X	\$34.50	Erb	W375			
	4X	\$34.50	Erb	W375			
5X	\$34.50	Erb	W375				
35	1	EA	ANSI Hooded Pull Over Sweatshirt		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Screenprint; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$31.50	Erb	W376			
	Medium	\$31.50	Erb	W376		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$31.50	Erb	W376		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$31.50	Erb	W376			
	2X	\$31.50	Erb	W376			
	3X	\$31.50	Erb	W376			
	4X	\$31.50	Erb	W376			
5X	\$31.50	Erb	W376				
36	1	EA	Lined Twill Jacket, Poly/Cotton Blend Quilt Lining		Universal	Navy, Brown	Embroidery; White
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$36.20	Red Kap	JT22			
	Medium	\$36.20	Red Kap	JT22		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$36.20	Red Kap	JT22		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$36.20	Red Kap	JT22			
	2X	\$42.65	Red Kap	JT22			
	3X	\$42.65	Red Kap	JT22			
	4X	\$42.65	Red Kap	JT22			
5X	\$42.65	Red Kap	JT22				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
37	1	EA	Flannel Lined Windbreaker		Universal	Navy	Embroidery; White
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Small	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		List Other Color Options	
	Medium						
	Large						
	XL						
	2X						
	3X						
	4X						
5X							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
38	1	EA	Duck Chore Coat		Universal	Dark Brown	Embroidery; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Small	\$67.20	Key	378		List Other Color Options	
	Medium	\$67.20	Key	378			
	Large	\$67.20	Key	378			
	XL	\$67.20	Key	378			
	2X	\$67.20	Key	378			
	3X	\$73.55	Key	378			
	4X	\$73.55	Key	378			
	5X	\$79.85	Key	378			
	M - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	L - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	2XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	3XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	4XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key	378			
	5XL - Tall	No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
39	1	EA	Duck Chore Coat w/Hood	Universal	Dark Brown	Embroidery; Black		
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number	Can you supply Yes or No
	Small	\$67.20	Key				376	List Other Color Options
	Medium	\$67.20	Key		376			
	Large	\$67.20	Key		376			
	XL	\$67.20	Key		376			
	2X	\$67.20	Key		376			
	3X	\$73.55	Key		376			
	4X	\$73.55	Key		376			
	5X	\$79.85	Key		376			
	M - Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
	L - Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
	XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
	2XL - Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
	3XL- Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
	4XL- Tall	\$73.55	Key		376			
5XL- Tall	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
40	1	EA	Duck Chore Coat w/Hood, Sherpa Lining	Universal	Brown	Embroidery; Black		
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number	Can you supply Yes or No
	Small	\$60.75	Key				372	List Other Color Options
	Medium	\$60.75	Key		372			
	Large	\$60.75	Key		372			
	XL	\$60.75	Key		372			
	2X	\$60.75	Key		372			
	3X	\$66.40	Key		372			
	4X	No Bid						
	5X	No Bid						
	M - Tall	\$66.40	Key		372			
	L - Tall	\$66.40	Key		372			
	XL - Tall	\$66.40	Key		372			
	2XL - Tall	\$66.40	Key		372			
	3XL- Tall	\$66.40	Key		372			
	4XL- Tall	No Bid						
5XL- Tall	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
41	1	EA	ANSI Two Tone Parka	Universal	Lime Green / Black	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$53.95	Erb				W144
	Medium	\$53.95	Erb		W144		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$53.95	Erb		W144		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$53.95	Erb		W144		
	2X	\$53.95	Erb		W144		
	3X	\$53.95	Erb		W144		
	4X	\$53.95	Erb		W144		
5X	\$53.95	Erb	W144				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
42	1	EA	ANSI 3 in 1 Deluxe Bomber (Hood w/Attached Liner)	Universal	Lime Green, Orange	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$48.95	Erb				W106
	Medium	\$48.95	Erb		W106		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$48.95	Erb		W106		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$48.95	Erb		W106		
	2X	\$48.95	Erb		W106		
	3X	\$48.95	Erb		W106		
	4X	\$48.95	Erb		W106		
	5X	\$48.95	Erb		W106		
	M - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	L - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	XL - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	2XL - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	3XL - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	4XL - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		
	5XL - Tall	\$53.50	Erb		S106T		

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
43	1	EA	ANSI 3 in 1 Deluxe Bomber (Hood w/Zip Out Liner)	Universal	Lime Green	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$57.95	Erb				W510
	Medium	\$57.95	Erb		W510		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$57.95	Erb		W510		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$57.95	Erb		W510		
	2X	\$57.95	Erb		W510		
	3X	\$57.95	Erb		W510		
	4X	\$57.95	Erb		W510		
5X	\$57.95	Erb	W510				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
44	1	EA	Port Authority Long Textured Hooded Soft Shell Jacket		Ladies	Black	Embroidery; White
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Small	No Bid	Port Authority	J792		List Other Color Options	
	Medium						
	Large						
	XL						
	2XL						
	3XL						
	4XL						
5XL							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
45	1	EA	Port Authority Nootka Jacket (City Logo Left Front Chest, Staff on Back)		Universal	Green, Black	Embroidery; Green w/ Black, Black w/ White
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Small	\$81.50	Port Authority	J792		List Other Color Options	
	Medium	\$81.50	Port Authority	J792			
	Large	\$81.50	Port Authority	J792			
	XL	\$81.50	Port Authority	J792			
	2XL	\$82.95	Port Authority	J792			
	3XL	\$85.95	Port Authority	J792			
	4XL	\$87.50	Port Authority	J792			
5XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
46	1	EA	Port Authority All-Conditions Jacket (City Logo Left Front Chest, Patch on Left Shoulder)		Universal	Black	Embroidery; White
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Small	\$50.50	Port Authority	J331		List Other Color Options	
	Medium	\$50.50	Port Authority	J331			
	Large	\$50.50	Port Authority	J331			
	XL	\$50.50	Port Authority	J331			
	2XL	\$51.95	Port Authority	J331			
	3XL	\$54.95	Port Authority	J331			
	4XL	\$56.50	Port Authority	J331			
5XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
47	1	EA	Insulated Duck Bib Overall w/ Full Leg Zipper	Universal	Brown	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$68.95	Key				275
	Medium	\$68.95	Key		275		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$68.95	Key		275		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$68.95	Key		275		
	2XL	\$68.95	Key		275		
	3XL	\$75.35	Key		275		
	4XL	\$75.35	Key		275		
	5XL	\$81.80	Key		275		
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
48	1	EA	Insulated Duck Bib Overall w/ Zipper up to Hip	Universal	Bark	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$88.25	Key				276
	Medium	\$88.25	Key		276		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$88.25	Key		276		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$88.25	Key		276		
	2XL	\$89.10	Key		276		
	3XL	\$96.75	Key		276		
	4XL	\$96.75	Key		276		
	5XL	\$105.15	Key		276		
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
49	1	EA	Insulated Duck Coverall	Universal	Brown	Embroidery; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$89.10	Key				975
	Medium	\$89.10	Key		975		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$89.10	Key		975		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$89.10	Key		975		
	2XL	\$89.10	Key		975		
	3XL	\$97.60	Key		975		
	4XL	\$97.60	Key		975		
	5XL	\$97.60	Key		975		
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
50	1	EA	Rainwear Bib Overall and Jacket w/Hood		Universal	Yellow	Embroidery; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$13.95	Neese	1600S			
	Medium	\$13.95	Neese	1600S			
	Large	\$13.95	Neese	1600S		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$13.95	Neese	1600S		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$13.95	Neese	1600S			
	3XL	\$14.95	Neese	1600S			
	4XL	\$14.95	Neese	1600S			
	5XL	\$14.95	Neese	1600S			
6XL	\$14.95	Neese	1600S				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
51	1	EA	ANSI Rain Pant, Elastic Waist		Universal	Lime Green, Orange	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small		No Bid				
	Medium	\$15.45	Erb	S373PT		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$15.45	Erb	S373PT		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$15.45	Erb	S373PT			
	2XL	\$15.45	Erb	S373PT			
	3XL	\$18.45	Erb	S373PT			
	4XL	\$18.45	Erb	S373PT			
	5XL	\$18.45	Erb	S373PT			
6XL		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
52	1	EA	ANSI Rain Pants w/ Bib Suspenders		Universal	Lime Green	Screen print; Black
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small		No Bid				
	Medium	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB			
	2XL	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB			
	3XL	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB			
	4XL	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB			
	5XL	\$30.75	Erb	S860BIB			
6XL		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
53	1	EA	ANSI Rain Coat w/Hood, Snap Front	Universal	Orange, Lime Green Can you supply Yes or No List Other Color Options	Screen print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	No Bid					
	Medium	\$25.50	Erb				S373
	Large	\$25.50	Erb				S373
	XL	\$25.50	Erb				S373
	2XL	\$25.50	Erb				S373
	3XL	\$31.15	Erb				S373
	4XL	\$31.15	Erb				S373
	5XL	\$31.15	Erb				S373
6XL	No Bid						
54	1	EA	ANSI Rain Trench Coat	Universal	Orange, Lime Green Can you supply Yes or No List Other Color Options	Screen print; Black	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	No Bid					
	Medium	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	Large	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	XL	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	2XL	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	3XL	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	4XL	\$39.70	Erb				S163
	5XL	\$39.70	Erb				S163
6XL	No Bid						
55	1	EA	ANSI Cuff Beanie	Universal	Lime Green Can you supply Yes or No	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	One Size	\$4.65	Erb				S109
56	1	EA	ANSI Boonie Hat	Universal	Lime Green; Orange Can you supply Yes or No	N/A	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	One Size	\$6.80	Erb				S230
57	1	EA	Khaki Hat, Navy Bill w/ Navy City Logo, Velcro Closure	Universal	Khaki, Navy Bill Can you supply Yes or No	Navy City Logo	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	One Size	\$7.95	Otto				23.430
58	1	EA	Khaki Hat, Hunter Bill w/ Hunter City Logo, Velcro Closure	Universal	Khaki, Hunter Bill Can you supply Yes or No	Hunter City Logo	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	One Size	\$7.95	Otto				23.430

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
59	1	EA	Leather Scratchless Belt		Universal	Black	N/A
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	28	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	30	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12		Can you supply Yes or No	
	32	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12		List Other Color Options	
	34	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	36	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	38	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	40	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	42	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	44	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	46	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
	48	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12			
50	\$16.10	Red Kap	AB12				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
60	1	EA	Pima Cotton Interlock Polo		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$26.50	Devon + Jones	D140S			
	Medium	\$26.50	Devon + Jones	D140S		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$26.50	Devon + Jones	D140S		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$26.50	Devon + Jones	D140S			
	2XL	\$29.50	Devon + Jones	D140S			
	3XL	\$30.95	Devon + Jones	D140S			
	4XL	\$32.50	Devon + Jones	D140S			
	5XL	No Bid					
	6XL	No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
61	1	EA	Core Performance Pique Polo		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$16.50	Core365	88181			
	Medium	\$16.50	Core365	88181		Can you supply Yes or No	
	Large	\$16.50	Core365	88181		List Other Color Options	
	XL	\$16.50	Core365	88181			
	2XL	\$17.95	Core365	88181			
	3XL	\$19.50	Core365	88181			
	4XL	\$20.95	Core365	88181			
	5XL	\$23.95	Core365	88181			
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
62	1	EA	Silk Touch Polo, Long Sleeve With Pocket		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$21.95	Port Authority	K500LSP			
	Medium	\$21.95	Port Authority	K500LSP			
	Large	\$21.95	Port Authority	K500LSP		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$21.95	Port Authority	K500LSP		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$23.50	Port Authority	K500LSP			
	3XL	\$26.50	Port Authority	K500LSP			
	4XL	\$27.95	Port Authority	K500LSP			
	5XL	No Bid					
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
63	1	EA	Silk Touch Polo, Long Sleeve Without Pocket		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$20.50	Port Authority	K500LS			
	Medium	\$20.50	Port Authority	K500LS			
	Large	\$20.50	Port Authority	K500LS		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$20.50	Port Authority	K500LS		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$21.95	Port Authority	K500LS			
	3XL	\$24.95	Port Authority	K500LS			
	4XL	\$26.50	Port Authority	K500LS			
	5XL	\$29.50	Port Authority	K500LS			
6XL	\$30.95	Port Authority	K500LS				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
64	1	EA	Easy Care Long Sleeve Button Down Shirt		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$21.95	Port Authority	S608			
	Medium	\$21.95	Port Authority	S608			
	Large	\$21.95	Port Authority	S608		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$21.95	Port Authority	S608		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$23.50	Port Authority	S608			
	3XL	\$26.50	Port Authority	S608			
	4XL	\$27.95	Port Authority	S608			
	5XL	\$30.95	Port Authority	S608			
6XL	\$32.50	Port Authority	S608				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
65	1	EA	Twill Shirt, Long Sleeve, 100% Cotton		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG8213			
	Medium	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG8213			
	Large	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG8213		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG8213		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$21.50	Blue Generation	BG8213			
	3XL	\$24.50	Blue Generation	BG8213			
	4XL	\$25.95	Blue Generation	BG8213			
	5XL	\$27.50	Blue Generation	BG8213			
6XL	\$28.95	Blue Generation	BG8213				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
66	1	EA	Cotton Polo w/ Pocket		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$21.95	Port Authority	K420P			
	Medium	\$21.95	Port Authority	K420P			
	Large	\$21.95	Port Authority	K420P		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$21.95	Port Authority	K420P		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$23.50	Port Authority	K420P			
	3XL	\$26.50	Port Authority	K420P			
	4XL	\$27.95	Port Authority	K420P			
	5XL	\$30.95	Port Authority	K420P			
6XL	\$32.50	Port Authority	K420P				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color
67	1	EA	Quarter Zip Pullover		Men's	Any	Any
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name	Model Number			
	Small	\$19.50	Century Place	350			
	Medium	\$19.50	Century Place	350			
	Large	\$19.50	Century Place	350		Can you supply Yes or No	
	XL	\$19.50	Century Place	350		List Other Color Options	
	2XL	\$20.95	Century Place	350			
	3XL	\$22.50	Century Place	350			
	4XL	\$23.95	Century Place	350			
	5XL			No Bid			
6XL							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
68	1	EA	Quarter Zip Sweatshirt	Men's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	Small	\$25.95	Sport-Tech				ST253
	Medium	\$25.95	Sport-Tech				ST253
	Large	\$25.95	Sport-Tech		ST253		Can you supply Yes or No
	XL	\$25.95	Sport-Tech		ST253		List Other Color Options
	2XL	\$27.50	Sport-Tech		ST253		
	3XL	\$30.50	Sport-Tech		ST253		
	4XL	\$31.95	Sport-Tech		ST253		
	5XL	No Bid					
6XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
69	1	EA	Modern Stretch, Cotton Cardigan	Women's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$23.50	Port Authority				L515
	Small	\$23.50	Port Authority				L515
	Medium	\$23.50	Port Authority		L515		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$23.50	Port Authority		L515		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$23.50	Port Authority		L515		
	2XL	\$24.95	Port Authority		L515		
	3XL	\$27.95	Port Authority		L515		
	4XL	\$29.50	Port Authority		L515		
5XL	No Bid						

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
70	1	EA	Long Sleeve Button Down	Women's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$21.95	Port Authority				L608
	Small	\$21.95	Port Authority				L608
	Medium	\$21.95	Port Authority		L608		Can you supply Yes or No
	Large	\$21.95	Port Authority		L608		List Other Color Options
	XL	\$21.95	Port Authority		L608		
	2XL	\$23.50	Port Authority		L608		
	3XL	\$26.50	Port Authority		L608		
	4XL	\$27.95	Port Authority		L608		
5XL	\$30.95	Port Authority	L608				

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
71	1	EA	Twill Shirt, Long Sleeve, 100% Cotton		Women's	Any	Any	
		Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG6213				
	Small	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG6213				
	Medium	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG6213		Can you supply Yes or No		
	Large	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG6213		List Other Color Options		
	XL	\$19.95	Blue Generation	BG6213				
	2XL	\$21.50	Blue Generation	BG6213				
	3XL	\$24.50	Blue Generation	BG6213				
	4XL	\$25.95	Blue Generation	BG6213				
5XL	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
72	1	EA	Long Sleeve, Polo		Women's	Any	Any	
		Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$17.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
	Small	\$17.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
	Medium	\$17.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS		Can you supply Yes or No		
	Large	\$17.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS		List Other Color Options		
	XL	\$17.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
	2XL	\$18.95	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
	3XL	\$20.50	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
	4XL	\$21.95	Tri Mountain	KL020LS				
5XL	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color		
73	1	EA	Polo		Women's	Any	Any	
		Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$18.95	Port Authority	LK8000				
	Small	\$18.95	Port Authority	LK8000				
	Medium	\$18.95	Port Authority	LK8000		Can you supply Yes or No		
	Large	\$18.95	Port Authority	LK8000		List Other Color Options		
	XL	\$18.95	Port Authority	LK8000				
	2XL	\$20.50	Port Authority	LK8000				
	3XL	\$23.50	Port Authority	LK8000				
	4XL	\$24.95	Port Authority	LK8000				
5XL	No Bid							

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
74	1	EA	Pique Polo	Women's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small		No Bid				
	Small	\$20.50	Extreme				75046
	Medium	\$20.50	Extreme		75046		
	Large	\$20.50	Extreme		75046		
	XL	\$20.50	Extreme		75046		
	2XL	\$23.50	Extreme		75046		
	3XL	\$24.95	Extreme		75046		
	4XL		No Bid				
5XL		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
75	1	EA	Silk Touch, ¾ Sleeve Polo	Women's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$20.50	Port Authority				L562
	Small	\$20.50	Port Authority				L562
	Medium	\$20.50	Port Authority		L562		
	Large	\$20.50	Port Authority		L562		
	XL	\$20.50	Port Authority		L562		
	2XL	\$21.95	Port Authority		L562		
	3XL	\$24.95	Port Authority		L562		
	4XL	\$26.50	Port Authority		L562		
5XL		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description	Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
76	1	EA	Quarter Zip Pullover	Women's	Any	Any	
	Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$19.50	Century Place				351
	Small	\$19.50	Century Place				351
	Medium	\$19.50	Century Place		351		
	Large	\$19.50	Century Place		351		
	XL	\$19.50	Century Place		351		
	2XL	\$20.95	Century Place		351		
	3XL	\$22.50	Century Place		351		
	4XL		No Bid				
5XL		No Bid					

Item	Qty	Unit	Description		Gender	Preferred Colors	Logo & Color	
77	1	EA	Quarter Zip Sweatshirt		Women's	Any	Any	
		Sizes	Cost	Brand Name				Model Number
	X-Small	\$25.95	Sport Tek	LST253				
	Small	\$25.95	Sport Tek	LST253				
	Medium	\$25.95	Sport Tek	LST253		Can you supply Yes or No		
	Large	\$25.95	Sport Tek	LST253		List Other Color Options		
	XL	\$25.95	Sport Tek	LST253				
	2XL	\$27.50	Sport Tek	LST253				
	3XL	\$30.50	Sport Tek	LST253				
	4XL	\$31.95	Sport Tek	LST253				
5XL	No Bid							